

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM

P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

Biennial Contract for Wallace & Tiernan
 Chlorinator Parts
 (July 7, 2015 through May 31, 2017)
 3:00 p.m., June 9, 2015

Environmental Improvements,
 Inc.
 235 Trademark Dr.
 Buda, TX 78610

Macaulay Controls Co.

Advanced Process

DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		UNIT			
GROUP 1					
1.	5 ea. Float Rotameter CL2 P/N U17952, Lawson No. 27574	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	669.22 3,346.10		
2.	5 ea. Regulator Vacuum Pressure P/N U29298, Lawson No. 27575	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,785.00 13,925.00		
3.	5 ea. Valve Pressure Regulator Check U27550-00, Lawson No. 27576	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,460.15 12,300.75		
4.	5 ea. Gasket Lead Used for CL2 P/N C-282G, Lawson No. 27577	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	29.00 145.00		
5.	5 ea. Filter Strainer CL2 P/N P41866, Lawson No. 27578	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	42.42 212.10		
6.	5 ea. Filter Gas Filter Pad Set CL2 P/N C-282P, Lawson No. 27579	UNIT PRICE TOTAL			
7.	5 ea. Tube Rotameter P/N PXB44057, Lawson No. 27580	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,358.00 11,790.00		
8.	5 ea. Gauge Vacuum Dial 30IN HG U26669-00, Lawson No. 27581	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	479.35 2,396.75		
9.	5 ea. Pump Webtrol Vertical Booster 2IN END Flange Inlet/Discharge, Lawson No. 27582	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	1,029.18 5,145.90		
10.	5 ea. Filter Nipple Plumbing Used for CL2 SZ 1 5.500 CRST P/N P13573, Lawson No. 27583	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	99.63 498.15		
11.	5 ea. Filter Body Inlet CRST P/N P58741, Lawson No. 27584	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	401.75 2,008.75		
12.	5 ea. Filter Gas Insert P/N C2821, Lawson No. 27585	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	49.00 245.00		
13.	5 ea. Valve Pressure Regulator CL2 P/N U275550-00, Lawson No. 27586	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,460.15 12,300.75		
14.	5 ea. Gasket Brass for Chlorination P/N P-41869, Lawson No. 12682	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	8.81 44.05		
15.	5 ea. Anode Magnesium Ionize Core P/N 39L P30764, Lawson No. 33308	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	86.79 433.95		
16.	5 ea. Valve Hydramotor 120 Volt 50/60 HZ P/N U20068, Lawson No. 33309	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,597.39 12,986.95		
17.	5 ea. Gauge Vacuum Mercury P/N U299194, Lawson No. 33735	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	324.23 1,621.15		
18.	5 ea. Gauge Vacuum Water P/N U299195, Lawson No. 33736	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	333.30 1,666.50		
				NO BID	NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM

P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

Biennial Contract for Wallace & Tiernan
 Chlorinator Parts
 (July 7, 2015 through May 31, 2017)
 3:00 p.m., June 9, 2015

Environmental Improvements,
 Inc.
 235 Trademark Dr.
 Buda, TX 78610

Macaulay Controls Co.

Advanced Process

DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

		UNIT	
19.	5 ea. Senson Chlorine P/N U29329, Lawson No. 33970	PRICE TOTAL	327.00 1,635.00
20.	5 ea. Gasket Inlet Lead P/N P12470, Lawson No. 12756	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	6.08 30.40
21.	5 ea. Heater Water CRMLX, 480 V, 12K P/N UXD28638, Lawson No. 39992	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	1,092.26 5,461.30
22.	5 ea. Heater Evaporator Heater Body P/N U28651, Lawson No. 39993	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,780.80 13,904.00
23.	5 ea. Anode Magnesium Iron Core P/N P30764, Lawson No. 39994	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	86.79 433.95
24.	5 ea. Diaphragm Gauge P/N U25912, Lawson No. 39995	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	659.69 3,298.45
25.	5 ea. Knob 1750 BLK PTC W/.2 P/N U19967, Lawson No. 39996	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	14.68 73.40
26.	5 ea. Elbow CL2 P/N P15483, Lawson No. 39997	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	23.01 115.05
27.	5 ea. Connector Plumb 500, 250 Poly P/N U24913, Lawson No. 39998	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	8.54 42.70
28.	5 ea. Switch Temperature W/Call DL P/N U28993, Lawson No. 39999	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	681.02 3,405.10
29.	5 ea. Gauge Temperature 20-220F P/N U19812-G, Lawson No. 40000	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	477.04 2,385.20
30.	5 ea. Level Probe Unit P/N UXB28589, Lawson No. 40001	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	68.14 340.70
31.	5 ea. Cylinder Series 5 Fabricated P/N U27894, Lawson No. 41527	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	10,574.36 52,871.80
			*
	TOTAL 1 YEAR	TOTAL	165,063.90
	TOTAL 2 YEARS	TOTAL	330,127.80
GROUP 2	PARTS		
1.	Percent of discount or markup offered		
2.	Product Identification (Mfg)		
3.	Type Price Schedule (Catalog Number, Dealer, Jobber, Etc.)		
4.	Price Schedule Number		
5.	Effective Date of price schedule		

NO BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM

P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

Biennial Contract for Wallace & Tiernan
 Chlorinator Parts
 (July 7, 2015 through May 31, 2017)
 3:00 p.m., June 9, 2015

Environmental Improvements,
 Inc.
 235 Trademark Dr.
 Buda, TX 78610

Macaulay Controls Co.

Advanced Process

DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)				
	EXTENSION 1		165,063.90		
	EXTENSION 2		165,063.90		
	EXTENSION 3		165,063.90		
	EXTENSION 4		165,063.90		
	Terms		Net 30 days		
	Delivery Days		30 days		

***LOW BIDDER**

BIDS INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Environmental Improvements, Inc.
 JCS Industries
 Macaulay Controls Co.
 Moody Brothers

Demandstar
 SAWS Website